
Gear up in your helmet 
and be ready to race 

your friends around our 
obstacle track with your 
choice of wheels, riding 

into the future! Whether 
you are into playing 

Roblox, Minecraft, or 
Pokémon, power up 
your device and let’s 

play! 

Get ready to jump into 
an unforgettable 

experience at Flip Out! 
This excursion is packed 

with high-flying fun, 
gravity-defying flips, and 

non- stop action. 
Challenge your friends 

to the running wall, 
master new tricks, and 
enjoy jumping around! 

SAMPLE PROGRAM 
 

Mon  Tue  Wed  Thu  Fri  

Reach new heights on 
our rock-climbing 

adventure. Challenge 
yourself with thrilling 

climbs, conquer exciting 
routes, and experience 
the ultimate adrenaline 
rush. Whether you’re a 

beginner or an 
experienced climber, this 
workshop is sure to be a 

rocking’ good time! 

Unleash your inner artist 
with this painting 

experience! Create 
vibrant masterpieces as 
you blend colours and 

explore various textures. 
Let your imagination 
flow and transform 
blank canvases into 

stunning works of art! 

Join the fun! 

Prepare yourself for a 
Beary special day at our 
Teddy Bears Picnic! Get 
ready to make your very 
own teddy bear and join 
us for a fun-filled picnic 

on the grass. Enjoy 
games, stories, and 

delicious treats, with 
your newly found teddy 

bear. 

 
 

 

  

Flip Out Tech & 
Wheels 

Early ‘Bee’ $76  
Standard Fee $86.50 

Authority Form Required 
IN-CENTRE 

 

Brush  
& Dab 

New Heights 

Authority Form Required Authority Form Required Authority Form Required 
EXCURSION WORKSHOP WORKSHOP 

Early ‘Bee’ $106 
Standard Fee $116.50 

Early ‘Bee’ $96 
Standard Fee $106.50 

Early ‘Bee’ $91 
Standard Fee $101.50 

Teddy Bears 
Picnic 

Early ‘Bee’ $91 
Standard Fee $101.50 

WORKSHOP 
Authority Form Required 




